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From the LLR ICB Corporate Governance Team
Our Ref: FOI23042025T
23 April 2025

 


Dear Requestor,

Freedom of Information Request 

Thank you for your email dated 23 April 2025 addressed to the Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland Integrated Care Board (LLR ICB) in respect of your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA). Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland Integrated Care Board confirm our response below (your request is set out in italics for ease of reference).

1. Please provide a list of the top 10 providers most frequently commissioned by the ICB/CHC to deliver healthcare services at home or individuals with complex needs.

Response: LLR ICB commission NHS Midlands and Lancashire Commissioning Support Unit (MLCSU) a care system support organisation to provide Personalised Healthcare Services including Continuing Healthcare (CHC) and Funded Nursing Care (FNC) Services across Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland (LLR).

MLCSU are unable to provide the requested information on providers frequently commissioned for complex care only as they do not record the information in a format to filter by complex care only. 
However, we can advise of the top 10 providers most frequently commissioned for care at home, which are listed below:

i. Precious Hope Health & Home Care Limited
ii. Carelink Healthcare Professionals LTD
iii. New Hope Care Leicester
iv. 2M Health and Home Care Services Limited
v. Care4U (Leicestershire) Limited
vi. Aspire (UK)
vii. The Caring Company Rutland Ltd
viii. Jewel Home Care Ltd
ix. Pure Homecare
x. First Choice Care Agency Limited

2. Please provide a list of specialist nursing homes or care settings approved by the ICB for long-term placements of adults with complex health needs – specifically those who require interventions such as tracheostomy care and/or mechanical ventilation.

Response: MLCSU do not hold information on specialist nursing homes or care settings approved for long-term placements of adults with complex health needs requiring interventions such as tracheostomy care and/or mechanical ventilation.

3. Please provide the contact details (e.g., team name, email address, and telephone number) of clinical teams responsible for managing Continuing Healthcare (CHC) funded services provided at home.

Response: The MLCSU Clinical Leads responsible for managing Continuing Healthcare (CHC) are Debra Chivers, Rodrigo Costa and Julie Nestor. They can be contacted via email at  MLCSUcsu.spallr@nhs.net and telephone on 0116504 0112.
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