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From the LLR ICB Corporate Governance Team
Our Ref: FOI29072025M
29 July 2025

 


Dear Requester,

Freedom of Information Request 


1. Does your organisation have an active Ostomy (stoma) or Continence Care Formulary? If so, please share copies of both formularies, including the full list of products? 

Response: Please see links below for details of the LLR Area Prescribing Committee (APC) STOMA Appliances and accessories Formulary and Prescribing Guidance and LLR Continence Prescribing Formulary October 2023:
· https://www.areaprescribingcommitteeleicesterleicestershirerutland.nhs.uk/wp-content/uploads/2015/05/StomaGuidelines.pdf

· https://www.areaprescribingcommitteeleicesterleicestershirerutland.nhs.uk/wp-content/uploads/2018/08/LLR-Continence-Formulary.pdf

2. What NHS organisations are they applicable to?

Response: The formularies are applicable to Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland ICB, University Hospitals of Leicester NHS Trust (UHL and Leicestershire Partnership NHS Trust (LPT).

3. When was the formulary start date, and when will it end or is expected to be renewed?

Response: This information is included within the respective formularies which can be found within the documents accessed via the above links in response to Question 1.

4. What is the primary objective of the formulary? If this is to deliver cost-improvement/savings, please quantify what savings the formulary has delivered to your organisation each year since it was active?

Response: There are several objectives of the formulary: to standardise and optimise the prescribing and usage of medical appliances, to promote cost-effectiveness, clinical effectiveness, and patient well-being.  It ensures patients receive appropriate, high-quality products while minimising waste and variation in practice. The ICB has not monitored any cost efficiencies since the formulary was implemented and therefore does not hold this information.

5. Which part of your organisation benefits from any Formulary savings?

Response: As the formularies are implemented across LLR, efficiencies will show against each of the relevant sector’s budget.

6. What is the process for renewal?

Response: A Formulary Working Group is formed, and the proposed formulary will be submitted to the Area Prescribing Committee for approval.

7. Where new, innovative products are launched while the formulary is live, what is the process for reviewing these and adding to the formulary?

Response: Relevant stakeholders will submit their proposals for review and consideration by the Area Prescribing Committee, which will then make a final decision.

8. Other than cost, how are outcomes measured and which outcomes are measured when assessing the effectiveness of the formulary?

Response: There has been no active monitoring of the appliance’s formularies, although ad-hoc patient and clinician feedback is taken into consideration.

9. Are stoma bags included within your formularies?

Response: Please see the link below for the formulary LLRAPC STOMA Appliances and accessories Formulary and Prescribing Guidance:  

· https://www.areaprescribingcommitteeleicesterleicestershirerutland.nhs.uk/wp-content/uploads/2015/05/StomaGuidelines.pdf

10. Who are the lead clinical stakeholder(s) responsible for the formularies – name and job role please?

Response: There is no designated lead, however, there is joint formulary working between stakeholders.

11. Who are the lead nonclinical stakeholder(s) responsible for the formularies – name and job role please?

Response: There is no designated lead, however, there is joint formulary working between stakeholders.

12. How is formulary compliance measured by healthcare professionals in your organisation?

Response: Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland ICB does not hold information regarding the methods healthcare professionals use to monitor formulary compliance.
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